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COMMITTEE ON NATURAL RESOURCES 

Disclosure Form  
As required by and provided for in House Rule XI, clause 2(g) and  

the Rules of the Committee on Natural Resources 
 

Oversight hearing on “The Endangered Species Act: How Litigation is Costing Jobs and Impeding  
True Recovery Efforts” 

 
 

 
* * * * * 

 
 
For Witnesses Representing Organizations: 
 

1. Name: Daniel J. Rohlf  
 
 

2.  Name of Organization(s) You are Representing at the Hearing:  
 
Pacific Environmental Advocacy Center (the domestic environmental law clinic at Lewis and Clark 
Law School) 

 
 

3. Business Address: 10015 S.W. Terwilliger Blvd.  Portland, OR  97219 
 
 

4. Business Email Address:  [Information redacted for privacy] 
 

 
5.  Business Phone Number: (503) 768-6707 

 
 
a. Any training or educational certificates, diplomas or degrees or other educational experiences that are 
relevant to your qualifications to testify on or knowledge of the subject matter of the hearing. 
 
I am a Professor of Law. I have a law degree from Stanford Law School.   
 
 
 
b. Any professional licenses, certifications, or affiliations held that are relevant to your qualifications to testify 
on or knowledge of the subject matter of the hearing. 
 
I am a member of the Oregon State Bar. I am a past Chair of the American Bar Association’s Endangered 
Species Committee.  
 
 
 
 
 



c. Any employment, occupation, ownership in a firm or business, or work-related experiences that relate to 
your qualifications to testify on or knowledge of the subject matter of the hearing. 
 
I have been studied and researched issues related to the Endangered Species Act since 1985. I have written a 
book and numerous articles about the Act, and I have litigated cases dealing with enforcement of the ESA for 
over two decades. I teach academic classes at covering the ESA Lewis and Clark Law School, and also teach 
students about litigation and provide them with real-world experience working on actual cases through my 
work with Lewis and Clark’s environmental law clinic.  
 
 
 
d. Any federal grants or contracts (including subgrants or subcontracts) from the Department of the Interior  
(and /or other agencies invited) that you have received in the current year and previous four years, including 
the source and the amount of each grant or contract. 
 
N/A 
 
 
e. A list of all lawsuits or petitions filed by you against the federal government in the current year and the 
previous four years, giving the name of the lawsuit or petition, the subject matter of the lawsuit or petition, 
and the federal statutes under which the lawsuits or petitions were filed. 
 
Please see the first list of cases in the attached spread sheet. Note that I am an attorney of record representing 
plaintiffs in these cases, not a plaintiff myself. 
 
 
 
f. Any other information you wish to convey that might aid the Members of the Committee to better 
understand the context of your testimony. 
 
 
 
In addition, for witnesses representing organizations: 
 
 
g. Any offices, elected positions, or representational capacity held in the organization(s) on whose behalf you 
are testifying. 
 
I am the co-founder of the Pacific Environmental Advocacy Center, Lewis and Clark Law School’s domestic 
environmental law clinic. I am on leave as PEAC’s Clinical Director, and currently serve the organization in 
an “of counsel” capacity.  
 
h. Any federal grants or contracts (including subgrants or subcontracts) from the Department of the Interior 
(and /or other agencies invited)  that were received in the current year and previous four years by the 
organization(s) you represent at this hearing, including the source and amount of each grant or contract for 
each of the organization(s). 
 
N/A 
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i. A list of all lawsuits or petitions filed by the organization(s) you represent at the hearing against the federal 
government in the current year and the previous four years, giving the name of the lawsuit or petition, the 
subject matter of the lawsuit or petition, and the federal statutes under which the lawsuits or petitions were 
filed for each of the organization(s). 
 
Please see the second list of cases in the attached spread sheet. Note that PEAC attorneys are counsel of 
record representing plaintiffs in these cases; PEAC is never a plaintiff itself in any litigation. 
 
 
 
j. A list of any countries from which the organization(s) you represent at the hearing have received foreign 
donations and the total amount of donations received from each country, for the current year and the previous 
four years, by each organization.  
 
N/A 
 
 
 
k. For tax-exempt organizations and non-profit organizations, copies of the three most recent public IRS Form 
990s (including Form 990-PF, Form 990-N, and Form 990-EZ) for each of the organization(s) you represent 
at the hearing (not including any contributor names and addresses or any information withheld from public 
inspection by the Secretary of the Treasury under 26 U.S.C. 6104)). 
 
The Pacific Environmental Advocacy Center is a program of Lewis and Clark Law School, which is a private, 
not-for-profit law school. The law school’s 990 forms are attached.  



Disclosure List

Case Number Case Name Statute(s) Subject

08‐0939 MO Northwest Environmental Defense 

Center v National Marine Fisheries 

Service et al

ESA, NEPA, APA Lake Oswego Dock

09‐0729 HA Audubon Society of Portland et al v 

Federal Emergency Management 

Agency

ESA Flood insurance program

11‐cv‐00494‐HU Audubon Society of Portland et al v. 

National Marine Fisheries Service 

(NMFS) et al

ESA, APA Willamette dredging/Post Office Bar Biological Opinion

07‐0038‐PHX‐MHM 

(D. Ariz.)

Center for Biological Diversity v. 

Kempthorne ESA Desert eagles listing

01‐cv‐00640‐SI National Wildlife Federation v. NMFS ESA Salmon Biological Opinion

09‐1089 (DC Circ.) Northwest Environmental Advocates 

v. EPA

CWA Ballast Water

11‐cv‐00662‐HU Northwest Environmental Advocates 

v. United States Environmental 

Protection Agency

CWA, APA Water quality standards

09‐0017 PK Northwest Environmental Advocates 

v Gutierrez et al

CZARA, CWA Nonpoint source pollution planning

09‐0929 JO Northwest Environmental Defense 

Center v NRI, Inc

CWA Stormwater enforcement

10‐cv‐01129‐AC Northwest Environmental Defense 

Center v. United States Army Corps of 

Engineers et al

ESA, FECA, 5 

U.S.C. App. II

Chetco

10‐cv‐00907‐BR Northwest Environmental Advocates 

v. National Marine Fisheries Service, 

et al.

ESA, APA Unreasonable delay federal agency action: Toxics water 

quality standards

3:10‐cv‐01397‐SI League of Wilderness Defenders/Blue 

Mountains Biodiversity Project v. 

United States Forest Service et al

NFMA, NEPA, 

CWA, APA

Wallowa‐Whitman Herbicide

08CV323‐SJM (W.D. 

Pa)

Forest Service Employees for 

Environmental Ethics v United States 

Forest Service

NEPA Allegheny oil and gas

CV‐10‐3050‐EFS Confederated Tribes and Bands of the 

Yakama Nation v USDA

Yakama Treaty of 

1855; federal 

Indian trust 

common law; 

NEPA; NHPA; 

American Indian 

Religious 

Freedom Act; 

Presidential 

Executive Orders 

13,175, 13,007

and 12,898; and 

the APA

Importation of Hawaiian garbage

12‐70668

Neighbors for Clean Air v. U.S. 

Environmental Protection Agency CAA Oregon SIP Petition

Daniel Rohlf's cases:

Other PEAC cases:
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NOTICE

GuideStar has been informed by the IRS of processing errors on IRS Forms 990 !led electronically 

between January 1, 2009, and December 3, 2010, for form year 2008.  These processing errors resulted 

in inaccurate data appearing on the scanned images of the affected returns that are posted on 

GuideStar and do not re#ect the information !led with the IRS.

 These errors include:

• Part III, line 1, organization's mission description—may not re#ect what was originally 

submitted by the nonpro!t organization. 

• Part VIII, line 8a, gross income for special events—values may have been transposed. 

• Part IX, line 7c, other salaries and wages, management and general expenses—may show 

a blank where a value was originally reported. 

• Schedule D, Part V, line 3a(ii), endowment funds and possession by related organizations—

checkbox values may have been transposed.

GuideStar is working with the IRS to obtain a corrected copy of its form year 2008 Form 990.  GuideStar 

will replace this Form 990 if, and when, the accurate return is made available from the IRS.

For more information, please visit  http://www2.guidestar.org/rxg/help/form-year-2008-returns.aspx 

http://www2.guidestar.org/rxg/help/form-year-2008-returns.aspx
http://www2.guidestar.org/rxg/help/form-year-2008-returns.aspx
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